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ACUTE RFP YHO09 Web Application Screen Prints

Arizona Health Care
Cost Containment System

AHCCCS
Login

Thank you for visiting AHCCCS Online. In order to use the site, you must have an active account. Please login or create a new account. For
questions, please contact our Customer Support Center at (602) 417-4451.

** ATTENTION **

Please remember that sharing account logins is prohibited and violates the AHCCCS User Acceptance Agreement. You must not share your user

name and password with any other individuals. Each user must have their own web account. Access to the web site can be terminated if the User
Acceptance Agreement is violated.

User Name: ||
Password:

Privacy Policy Contact Us
AHCCCS, 801, Jefferson, Phoenix, AZ 85034, (602) 417-4000
Copyright 2003 AHCCCS, All Rights Reserved
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Figure 1. Acute RFP YHO9 Login Page
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Capitation Proposal Capitation Proposal Page Initial End Date: 3/28/2008 3:00:01 PM
Capitation Final End Date: 4/30/2008 3:00:00 PM
My Health Plan
1/31/2008 9:31:14 AM
Account Information Initial Bid (ends 3/28/2008 3:00:01 PM)
Save and submit bid to AHCCCS
| myhealthplan |
Initial Bid
Cancel Bid Cancel Bid Cancel Bid Cancel Bid Cancel Bid Cancel Bid Cancel Bid
Risk Group GSA2 GSA4 GSAG GSAS GSA10 GSA12 GSA14
TANF < 1 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Ho Bid No Bid
TANF 1-13 No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
TANF 14-44F No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Ho Bid No Bid
TANF 14-44M No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TANF 45+ No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SSIW No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SSIW/0 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MED No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid HNo Bid No Bid
HNON-MED No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
%tn:lmsme Composite Composite Composite Composite Composite Composite Composite
Final Bid
Risk Group GSA2 GSA4 GSAG GSAS GSA10 GSA12 GSA14
TANF < 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TANF 1-13 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TANF 14-44F No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
TANF 14-44M  |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid
TANF 45+ No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
S5IW No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid
SSIwW/0 No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
MED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid
NON-MED No Bid MNo Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
%t";?os'te Composite Composite Composite Composite Composite Composite Composite
‘@ l_ l_ ’_ ’_ l_ q Local intranet
Figure 2. Capitation Proposal Page
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Capitation

Account Information

|myhea|thp\an |

Capitation Proposal Capitation Calculation for Rates
My Health Plan Geographical Service Area 2 (GSA2)
1/31/2008 11:16:51 AM
Initial Bid (ends 3/28/2008 3:00:01 PM) Risk Group: 55T W
Annualized
a o Units Per Cost Per
Service Categories 1000 Unit Cost PMPM
Hospital Inpatient [ /1000 § j12 $-
Outpatient Fadility | /1000 § j12 $-
Emergency Room | /1000 § j12 $-
Primary Care | /1000 § 12 5 -
Referral Physician | /1000 § 12 5 -
other Professional | /1000 4| 12 §-
Pharmacy | /1000 %| 12 §-
Emergency and Non Emergency Trans | /1000 § j12 -
Dental [ /1000 j12 -
Laboratory, X-ray, Med Image [ /1000 j12 -
Physical Therapy [ /1000 j12 -
DME and Oxygen [ /1000 j12 -
NF and Home Health Care [ /1000 j12 -
Miscellaneous [ /1000 j12 -
Gross Capitation Rate $-
Reinsurance - $|: 1
Third Party Recoveries = $|
Administration Charges $|
Risk and Contingencies + $|
Total Adjustments $-
Net Capitation Rate $-
Final Capitation W/Premium Tax 5 -
[ Calculate Total and Save Bid | [ close |
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Figure 3. Capitation Calculation for Rates Page
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Arizona Health Care
Cost Containment System

AHCCCS
Logout

ol s Composite Rate Calculation
Capitation

My Health Plan - -
1/31/2008 9:43:04 AM Composite Rate Calculation for GSA

Initial Bid (ends 3/28/2008 3:00:01 PM)

Account Information

| myhealthplan ‘

TANF < 1 £0.00 4.46 % $0.00
TANF 1-13 £0.00 35.56 % $0.00
TANF 14-44F $0.00 10.29 % $0.00
TANF 14-44M $0.00 19.93 % $0.00
TANF 45+ $0.00 4.79 % $0.00
SSIW $0.00 8.63 % $0.00
SSIW/0 50.00 4.27 % $0.00
MED 50.00 0.36 % $0.00
MNON MED $0.00 11.71 % $0.00

$0.00
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Figure 4. Composite Rate Calculation Page
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